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The Shadow shall rise across the world, and darken every land, even to the
smallest corner, and there shall be neither Light nor safety. And he who
shall be born of the Dawn, born of the Maiden, according to Prophecy, he
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in the pain of salvation. All Glory be to the Creator, and to the Light, and to
he who shall be born again. May the Light save us from him.
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Seeds of Shadow

he Wheel of Time turns, and Ages come and pass, leaving memories that
become legend. Legend fades to myth, and even myth is long forgotten
when the Age that gave it birth comes again. In one Age, called the Third
Age by some, an Age yet to come, an Age long past, a wind rose on the
great plain called the Caralain Grass. The wind was not the beginning.
There are neither beginnings nor endings to the turning of the Wheel of
Time. But it was a beginning.

North and west the wind blew beneath early morning sun, over endless
miles of rolling grass and far-scattered thickets, across the swift-flowing
River Luan, past the broken-topped fang of Dragonmount, mountain of
legend towering above the slow swells of the rolling plain, looming so high
that clouds wreathed it less than halfway to the smoking peak.
Dragonmount, where the Dragon had died-and with him, some said, the
Age of Legends-where prophecy said he would be born again. Or had been.
North and west, across the villages of Jualdhe and Darein and Alindaer,
where bridges like stone lacework arched out to the Shining Walls, the great
white walls of what many called the greatest city in the world. Tar Valon. A
city just touched by the reaching shadow of Dragonmount each evening.

Within those walls Ogier-made buildings well over two thousand years old
seemed to grow out of the ground rather than having been built, or to be the
work of wind and water rather than that of even the fabled hands of Ogier
stone-masons. Some suggested birds taking flight, or huge shells from
distant seas. Soaring towers, flared or fluted or spiraled, stood connected by
bridges hundreds of feet in the air, often without rails.

Only those long in Tar Valon could avoid gaping like country folk who had
never been off the farm.

Greatest of those towers, the White Tower dominated the city, gleaming like
polished bone in the sun.



The Wheel of Time turns around Tar Valon, so people said in the city, and
Tar Valon turns around the Tower.

The first sight travelers had of Tar Valon, before their horses came in view
of the bridges, before their river boat captains sighted the island, was the
Tower reflecting the sun like a beacon. Small wonder then that the great
square surrounding the walled Tower grounds seemed smaller than it was
under the massive Tower’s gaze, the people in it dwindling to insects. Yet
the White Tower could have been the smallest in Tar Valon, the fact that it
was the heart of Aes Sedai power would still have overawed the island city.

Despite their numbers, the crowd did not come dose to filling the square.
Along the edges people jostled each other in a milling mass, all going about
their day’s business, but closer to the Tower grounds there were ever fewer
people, until a band of bare paving stones at least fifty paces wide bordered
the tall white walls. Aes Sedai were respected and more in Tar Valon, of
course, and the Amyrlin Seat ruled the city as she ruled the Aes Sedai, but
few wanted to be closer to Aes Sedai power than they had to. There was a
difference between being proud of a grand fireplace in your hall and
walking into the flames.

A very few did go closer, to the broad stairs that led up to the Tower itself,
to the intricately carved doors wide enough for a dozen people abreast.
Those doors stood open, welcoming. There were always some people in
need of aid or an answer they thought only Aes Sedai could give, and they
came from far as often as near, from Arafel and Ghealdan, from Saldaea
and Illian. Many would find help or guidance inside, though often not what
they had expected or hoped for.

Min kept the wide hood of her cloak pulled up, shadowing her face in its
depths. In spite of the warmth of the day, the garment was light enough not
to attract comment, not on a woman so obviously shy. And a good many
people were shy when they went to the Tower. There was nothing about her
to attract notice. Her dark hair was longer than when she was last in the
Tower, though still not quite to her shoulders, and her dress, plain blue
except for narrow bands of white Jaerecuz lace at neck and wrists, would
have suited the daughter of a well-to-do farmer, wearing her feastday best to
the Tower just like the other women approaching the wide stairs. Min hoped



she looked the same, at least. She had to stop herself from staring at them to
see if they walked or held themselves differently. I can do it, she told
herself.

She had certainly not come all this way to turn back now. The dress was a
good disguise. Those who remembered her in the Tower remembered a
young woman with close-cropped hair, always in a boy’s coat and breeches,
never in a dress. It had to be a good disguise. She had no choice about what
she was doing. Not really.

Her stomach fluttered the closer she came to the Tower, and she tightened
her grip on the bundle clutched to her breast. Her usual clothes were in
there, and her good boots, and all her possessions except the horse she had
left at an inn not far from the square. With luck, she would be back on the
gelding in a few hours, riding for the Ostrein Bridge and the road south.

She was not really looking forward to climbing onto a horse again so soon,
not after weeks in the saddle with never a day’s pause, but she longed to
leave this place. She had never seen the White Tower as hospitable, and
right now it seemed nearly as awful as the Dark One’s prison at Shayol
Ghul. Shivering, she wished she had not thought of the Dark One. I wonder
if Moiraine thinks I came just because she asked me? The Light help me,
acting like a fool girl. Doing fool things because of a fool man!

She mounted the stairs uneasily - each was deep enough to take two strides
for her to reach the next -

and unlike most of the others, she did not pause for an awed stare up the
pale height of the Tower. She wanted this over.

Inside, archways almost surrounded he large, round entry hall, but the
petitioners huddled in the middle of the chamber, shuffling together beneath
a flat-domed ceiling. The pale stone floor had been worn and polished by
countless nervous feet over the centuries. No one thought of anything
except where they were, and why. A farmer and his wife in rough woolens,
clutching each other’s callused hands, rubbed shoulders with a merchant in
velvet-slashed silks, a maid at her heels clutching a small worked-silver
casket, no doubt her mistress’s gift for the Tower. Elsewhere, the merchant



would have stared down her nose at farm folk who brushed so close, and
they might well have knuckled their foreheads and backed away
apologizing. Not now.

Not here.

There were few men among the petitioners, which was no surprise to Min.
Most men were nervous around Aes Sedai. Everyone knew it had been male
Aes Sedai, when there still had been male Aes Sedai, who were responsible
for the Breaking of the World. Three thousand years had not dimmed that
memory, even if time had altered many of the details. Children were still
frightened by tales of men who could channel the One Power, men doomed
to go mad from the Dark One’s taint on saidin, the male half of the True
Source. Worst was the story of Lews Therin Telamon, the Dragon, Lews
Therin Kinslayer, who had begun the Breaking. For that matter, the stories
frightened adults, too. Prophecy said the Dragon would be born again in
mankind’s greatest hour of need, to fight the Dark One in Tarmon Gai’don,
the Last Battle, but that made little difference in how most people looked at
any connection between men and the Power. Any Aes Sedai would hunt
down a man who could channel, now; of the seven Ajahs, the Red did little
else.

Of course, none of that had anything to do with seeking help from Aes
Sedai, yet few men felt easy about being linked in any way to Aes Sedai
and the Power. Few, that is, except Warders, but each Warder was bonded to
an Aes Sedai; Warders could hardly be taken for the general run of men.
There was a saying: “A man will cut off his own hand to get rid of a splinter
before asking help from Aes Sedai.” Women meant it as a comment on
men’s stubborn foolishness, but Min had heard some men say the loss of a
hand might be the better decision.

She wondered what these people would do if they knew what she knew.
Run screaming, perhaps. And if they knew her reason for being here, she
might not survive to be taken up by the Tower guards and thrown into a
cell. She did have friends in the Tower, but none with power or influence. If
her purpose was discovered, it was much less likely that they could help her
than that she would pull them to the gallows or the headsman



behind her. That was saying she lived to be tried, of course; more likely her
mouth would be stopped permanently long before a trial.

She told herself to stop thinking like that. I’ll make it in, and I’ll make it
out. The Light burn Rand al’Thor for getting me into this!

Three or four Accepted, women Min’s age or perhaps a little older, were
circulating through the round room, speaking softly to the petitioners. Their
white dresses had no decoration except for seven bands of color at the hem,
one band for each Ajah. Now and again a novice, a still younger woman or
girl all in white, came to lead someone deeper into the Tower. The
petitioners always followed the novices with an odd mix of excited
eagerness and foot-dragging reluctance.

Min’s grip tightened on her bundle as one of the Accepted stopped in front
of her. “The Light illumine you,” the curly-haired woman said
perfunctorily. “I am called Faolain. How may the Tower help you?”

Faolain’s dark, round face held the patience of someone doing a tedious job
when she would rather be doing something else. Studying, probably, from
what Min knew of the Accepted. Learning to be Aes Sedai.

Most important, however, was the lack of recognition in the Accepted’s
eyes; the two of them had met when Min was in the Tower before, though
only briefly.

Just the same, Min lowered her face in assumed diffidence. It was not
unnatural; a good many country folk did not really understand the great step
up from Accepted to full Aes Sedai. Shielding her features behind the edge
of her cloak, she looked away from Faolain.

“I have a question I must ask the Amyrlin Seat,” she began, then cut off
abruptly as three Aes Sedai stopped to look into the entry hall, two from
one archway and one from another.

Accepted and novices curtsied when their rounds took them dose to one of
the Aes Sedai, but otherwise went on about their tasks, perhaps a trifle more
briskly. That was all. Not so for the petitioners. They seemed to catch their



breaths all together. Away from the White Tower, away from Tar Valon,
they might simply have thought the Aes Sedai three women whose ages
they could not guess, three women in the flush of their prime, yet with more
maturity than their smooth cheeks suggested. In the Tower, though, there
was no question. A woman who had worked very long with the One Power
was not touched by time in the same way as other women. In the Tower, no
one needed to see a golden Great Serpent ring to know an Aes Sedai.

A ripple of curtsies spread through the huddle, and jerky bows from the few
men. Two or three people even fell to their knees. The rich merchant looked
frightened; the farm couple at her side stared at legends come to life. How
to deal with Aes Sedai was a matter of hearsay for most; it was unlikely that
any here, except those who actually lived in Tar Valon, had seen an Aes
Sedai before, and probably not even the Tar Valoners had been this dose.

But it was not the Aes Sedai themselves that halted Min’s tongue.
Sometimes, not often, she saw things when she looked at people, images
and auras that usually flared and were gone in moments. Occasionally she
knew what they meant. It happened rarely, the knowing-much more rarely
that the seeing, even-but when she knew, she was always right.

Unlike most others, Aes Sedai - and their Warders - always had images and
auras, sometimes so many dancing and shifting that they made Min dizzy.
The numbers made no difference in interpreting them, though; she knew
what they meant for Aes Sedai as seldom as for anyone else. But this time
she knew more than she wanted to, and it made her shiver.

A slender woman with black hair falling to her waist, the only one of the
three she recognized - her name was Ananda; she was Yellow Ajah - wore a
sickly brown halo, shriveled and split by rotting fissures that fell in and
widened as they decayed. The small, fair-haired Aes Sedai beside Ananda
was Green Ajah, by her green-fringed shawl. The White Flame of Tar Valon
on it showed for a moment when she turned her back. And on her shoulder,
as if nestled among the grape vines and flowering apple branches worked
on her shawl, sat a human skull. A small woman’s skull, picked dean and
sun-bleached. The third, a plumply pretty woman halfway around the room,
wore no shawl; most Aes Sedai did not except for ceremony. The lift of her
chin and the set of her shoulders spoke of strength and pride. She seemed to



be casting cool, blue eyes on the petitioners through a tattered curtain of
blood, crimson streamers running down her face.

Blood and skull and halo faded away in the dance of images around the
three, came and faded again.

The petitioners stared in awe, seeing only three women who could touch the
True Source and channel the One

Power. No one but Min saw the rest. No one but Min knew those three
women were going to die. All on the same day.

“The Amyrlin cannot see everyone,” Faolain said with poorly hidden
impatience. “Her next public audience is not for ten days. Tell me what you
want, and I will arrange for you to see the sister who can best help you.”

Min’s eye flew to the bundle in her arms and stayed there, partly so she
would not have to see again what she had already seen. All three of them!
Light! What chance was there that three Aes Sedai would die on the same
day? But she knew. She knew.

“I have the right to speak to the Amyrlin Seat. In person.” It was a right
seldom demanded - who would dare? - but it existed. “Any woman has that
right, and I ask it.”

“Do you think the Amyrlin Seat herself can see everyone who comes to the
White Tower? Surely another Aes Sedai can help you.” Faolain gave heavy
weight to the titles as if to overpower Min. “Now tell me what your
question is about. And give me your name, so the novice will know who to
come for.”

“My name is . . . Elmindreda.” Min winced in spite of herself. She had
always hated the name, but the Amyrlin was one of the few people living
who had ever heard it. If only she remembered. “I have the right to speak to
the Amyrlin. And my question is for her alone. I have the right.”

The Accepted arched an eyebrow. “Elmindreda?” Her mouth twitched
toward an amused smile. “And you claim your rights. Very well. I will send



word to the Keeper of the Chronicles that you wish to see the Amyrlin Seat
personally, Elmindreda.”

Min wanted to slap the woman for the way she emphasized “Elmindreda,”
but instead she forced out a murmured “Thank you.”

“Do not thank me yet. No doubt it will be hours before the Keeper finds
time to reply, and it will certainly be that you can ask your question at the
Mother’s next public audience. Wait with patience.

Elmindreda.” She gave Min a tight smile, almost a smirk, as she turned
away.

Grinding her teeth, Min took her bundle to stand against the wall between
two of the archways, where she tried to blend into the pale stonework. Trust
no one, and avoid notice until you reach the Amyrlin, Moiraine had told
her. Moiraine was one Aes Sedai she did trust. Most of the time. It was
good advice in any case. All she had to do was reach the Amyrlin, and it
would be over. She could don her own clothes again, see her friends, and
leave. No more need for hiding.

She was relieved to see that the Aes Sedai had gone. Three Aes Sedai dying
on one day. It was impossible; that was the only word. Yet it was going to
happen. Nothing she said or did could change it-when she knew what an
image meant, it happened-but she had to tell the Amyrlin about this. It
might even be as important as the news she brought from Moiraine, though
that was hard to believe.

Another Accepted came to replace one already there, and to Min’s eyes bars
floated in front of her apple-cheeked face, like a cage. Sheriam, the Mistress
of Novices, looked into the hall-after one glance, Min kept her gaze on the
stone under her feet; Sheriam knew her all too well - and the red-haired Aes
Sedai’s face seemed battered and bruised. It was only the viewing, of
course, but Min still had to bite her lip to stifle a gasp.

Sheriam, with her calm authority and sureness, was as indestructible as the
Tower. Surely nothing could harm Sheriam. But something was going to.



An Aes Sedai unknown to Min, wearing the shawl of the Brown Ajah,
accompanied a stout woman in finely woven red wool to the doors. The
stout woman walked as lightly as a girl, face shining, almost laughing with
pleasure. The Brown sister was smiling, too, but her aura faded like a
guttering candle flame.

Death. Wounds, captivity, and death. To Min it might as well have been
printed on a page.

She set her eyes on her feet. She did not want to see any more. Let her
remember, she thought. She had not felt desperation at any time on her long
ride from the Mountains of Mist, not even on the two occasions when
someone tried to steal her horse, but she felt it now. Light, let her remember
that bloody name.

“Mistress Elmindreda?”

Min gave a start. The black-haired novice who stood before her was barely
old enough to be away from home, perhaps fifteen or sixteen, though she
made a great effort at dignity. “Yes? I am . . . . That is my name.’

“I am Sahra. If you will come with me - ” Sahra’s piping voice took on a
note of wonder - the Amyrlin Seat will see you in her study now.’

Min gave a sigh of relief and followed eagerly.

Her cloak’s deep hood still hid her face, but it did not stop her seeing, and
the more she saw, the more she grew eager to reach the Amyrlin. Few
people walked the broad corridors that spiraled upward with their brightly
colored floor tiles, and their wall hangings and golden lampstands - the
Tower had been built to hold far greater numbers than it did now - but
nearly everyone she saw as she climbed higher wore an image or aura that
spoke to her of violence and danger.

Warders hurried by with barely a glance for the two women, men who
moved like hunting wolves, their swords only an afterthought to their
deadliness, but they seemed to have bloody faces, or gaping wounds.



Swords and spears danced about their heads, threatening. Their auras
flashed wildly, flickered on the knife edge of death. She saw dead men
walking, knew they would die on the same day as the Aes Sedai in the entry
hall, or at most a day later. Even some of the servants, men and women with
the Flame of Tar Valon on their breasts, hurrying about their work, bore
signs of violence. An Aes Sedai glimpsed down a side hallway appeared to
have chains in the air around her, and another, crossing the corridor ahead
of Min and her guide, seemed for most of those few strides to wear a silver
collar around her neck. Min’s breath caught at that; she wanted to scream.

“It can all be overwhelming to someone who’s never seen it before,” Sahra
said, trying and failing to sound as if the Tower were as ordinary to her now
as her home village. “But you are safe here. The Amyrlin Seat will make
things right.” Her voice squeaked when she mentioned the Amyrlin.

“Light, let her do just that,” Min muttered. The novice gave her a smile that
was meant to be soothing.

By the time they reached the hall outside the Amyrlin’s study, Min’s
stomach was churning and she was treading almost on Sahra’s heels. Only
the need to pretend that she was a stranger had kept her from running ahead
long since.

One of the doors to the Amyrlin’s chambers opened, and a young man with
red-gold hair came stalking out, nearly striding into Min and her escort. Tall
and straight and strong in his blue coat thickly embroidered with gold on
sleeves and collar, Gawyn of House Trakand, eldest son of Queen Morgase
of Andor, looked every inch the proud young lord. A furious young lord.
There was no time to drop her head; he was staring down into her hood,
right into her face.

His eyes widened in surprise, then narrowed to slits of blue ice. “So you are
back. Do you know where my sister and Egwene have gone?”

“They are not here?” Min forgot everything in a rising flood of panic.
Before she knew what she was doing she had seized his sleeves, peering up
at him urgently, and forced him back a step. “Gawyn, they started for the



Tower months ago! Elayne and Egwene, and Nynaeve, too. With Verin
Sedai and . . . Gawyn, I . . . I. . .”

“Calm yourself,” he said, gently undoing her grip on his coat. “Light! I
didn’t mean to frighten you so.

They arrived safely. And would not say a word of where they had been, or
why. Not to me. I suppose there’s scant hope you will?” She thought she
kept her face straight, but he took one look and said, “I thought not. This
place has more secrets than . . . . They’ve vanished again. And Nynaeve,
too.” Nynaeve was almost an offhand addition; she might be one of Min’s
friends, but she meant nothing to him. His voice began to roughen once
more, growing tighter by the second. “Again without a word. Not a word!
Supposedly they’re on a farm somewhere as penance for running away, but
I cannot find out where. The Amyrlin won’t give me a straight answer.”

Min flinched; for a moment, streaks of dried blood had made his face a
grim mask. It was like a double hammer blow. Her friends were gone - it
had eased her coming to the Tower, knowing they were here - and Gawyn
was going to be wounded on the day the Aes Sedai died.

Despite all she had seen since entering the Tower, despite her fear, none of
it had really touched her personally until now. Disaster striking the Tower
would spread far from Tar Valon, yet she was not of the Tower and never
could be. But Gawyn was someone she knew, someone she liked, and he
was going to be hurt more than the blood told, hurt somehow deeper than
wounds to his flesh. It hit her that if catastrophe seized the Tower, not only
distant Aes Sedai would be harmed, women she could never feel close to,
but her friends as well. They were of the Tower.

In a way she was glad Egwene and the others were not there, glad she could
not look at them and perhaps see signs of death. Yet she wanted to look, to
be sure, to look at her friends and see nothing, or see that they would live.
Where in the Light were they? Why had they gone? Knowing those three,
she thought it possible that if Gawyn did not know where they were, it was
because they did not want him to know. It could be that.



Suddenly she remembered where she was and why, and that she was not
alone with Gawyn. Sahra seemed to have forgotten she was taking Min to
the Amyrlin; she seemed to have forgotten everything but the young lord,
making calf-eyes that he was not noticing. Even so, there was no use
pretending any longer to be a stranger to the Tower. She was at the
Amyrlin’s door; nothing could stop her now.

“Gawyn, I don’t know where they are, but if they are doing penance on a
farm, they’re probably all sweat, and mud to their hips, and you are the last
one they will want to see them.” She was not much easier about their
absence than Gawyn was, in truth. Too much had happened, too much was
happening, too much with ties to them, and to her. But it was not impossible
they had been sent off for punishment. “You won’t help them by making the
Amyrlin angry.”

“I don’t know that they are on a farm. Or even alive. Why all this hiding
and sidestepping if they’re just pulling weeds? If anything happens to my
sister . . . . Or to Egwene. . . .” He frowned at the toes of his boots. “I am
supposed to look after Elayne. How can I protect her when I don’t know
where she is?”

Min sighed. “Do you think she needs looking after? Either of them?” But if
the Amyrlin had sent them somewhere, maybe they did. The Amyrlin was
capable of sending a woman into a bear’s den with nothing but a switch if it
suited her purposes. And she would expect the woman to come back with a
bearskin, or the bear on a leash, as instructed. But telling Gawyn that would
only inflame his temper and his worries. “Gawyn, they have pledged to the
Tower. They won’t thank you for meddling.”

“I know Elayne isn’t a child,” he said patiently, “even if she does bounce
back and forth between running off like one and playing at being Aes Sedai.
But she a my sister, and beyond that, she is Daughter-Heir of Andor. She’ll
be queen, after Mother. Andor needs her whole and safe to take the throne,
not another Succession.”

Playing at being Aes Sedai? Apparently he did not realize the extent of his
sister’s talent. The DaughterHeirs of Andor had been sent to the Tower to
train for as long as there had been an Andor, but Elayne was the first to



have enough talent to be raised to Aes Sedai, and a powerful Aes Sedai at
that. Very likely he also did not know Egwene was just as strong.

“So you will protect her whether she wants it or not?” She said it in a flat
voice meant to let him know he was making a mistake, but he missed the
warning and nodded agreement.

“That has been my duty since the day she was born. My blood shed before
hers; my life given before hers. I took that oath when I could barely see
over the side of her cradle; Gareth Bryne had to explain to me what it
meant. I won’t break it now. Andor needs her more than it needs me.”

He spoke with a calm certainty, an acceptance of something natural and
right, that sent chills through her. She had always thought of him as boyish,
laughing and teasing, but now he was something alien. She thought the
Creator must have been tired when it came time to make men; sometimes
they hardly seemed human. “And Egwene? What oath did you take about
her?”

His face did not change, but he shifted his feet warily. “I’m concerned about
Egwene, of course. And Nynaeve. What happens to Elayne’s companions
might happen to Elayne. I assume they’re still together; when they were
here, I seldom saw one without the others.”

“My mother always told me to marry a poor liar, and you qualify. Except
that I think someone else has first claim.”

“Some things are meant to be,” he said quietly, “and some never can. Galad
is heartsick because Egwene is gone.” Galad was his half-brother, the pair
of them sent to Tar Valon to train under the Warders. That was another
Andoran tradition. Galadedrid Damodred was a man who took doing the
right thing to the point of a fault, as Min saw it, but Gawyn could see no
wrong in him. And he would t speak his feelings for a woman Galad had set
his heart on.

She wanted to shake him, shake some sense into him, but there was no time
now. Not with the Amyrlin waiting, not with what she had to tell the
Amyrlin waiting. Certainly not with Sahra standing there, calf-eyes or no



calf-eyes. “Gawyn, I am summoned to the Amyrlin. Where can I find you,
when she is done with me?”

“I will be in the practice yard. The only time I can stop worrying is when I
am working the sword with Hammar.” Hammar was a blademaster, and the
Warder who taught the sword. “Most days I’m there until the sun sets.”

“Good, then. I will come as soon as I can. And try to watch what you say. If
you make the Amyrlin angry with you, Elayne and Egwene might share in
it.”

“That I cannot promise,” he said firmly. “Something is wrong in the world.
Civil war in Cairhien. The same and worse in Tarabon and Arad Doman.
False Dragons. Troubles and rumors of troubles everywhere. I don’t say the
Tower is behind it, but even here things are not what they should be. Or
what they seem. Elayne and Egwene vanishing isn’t the whole of it. Still,
they are the part that concerns me. I will find out where they are. And if
they have been hurt . . . . If they are dead . . . .”

He scowled, and for an instant his face was that bloody mask again. More: a
sword floated above his head, and a banner waved behind it. The long-
hilted sword, like those most Warders used, had a heron engraved on its
slightly curved blade, symbol of a blademaster, and Min could not say
whether it belonged to Gawyn or threatened him. The banner bore Gawyn’s
sigil of the charging White Boar, but on a field of green rather than the red
of Andor. Both sword and banner faded with the blood.

“Be careful, Gawyn.” She meant it two ways. Careful of what he said, and
careful in a way she could not explain, even to herself. “You must be very
careful.”

His eyes searched her face as if he had heard some of her deeper meaning.
“I . . . will try,” he said finally. He put on a grin, almost the grin she
remembered, but the effort was plain. “I suppose I had better get myself
back to the practice yard if I expect to keep up with Galad. I managed two
out of five against Hammar this morning, but Galad actually won three, the
last time he bothered to come to the yard.” Suddenly he appeared to really
see her for the first time, and his grin became genuine. “You ought to wear



dresses more often. It’s pretty on you. Remember, I will be there till
sunset.”

As he strode away with something very close to the dangerous grace of a
Warder, Min realized she was smoothing the dress over her hip and stopped
immediately. The Light burn all men!

Sahra exhaled as if she had been holding her breath. “He is very good-
looking, isn’t he?” she said dreamily. “Not as good-looking as Lord Galad,
of course. And you really know him.” It was half a question, but only half.

Min echoed the novice’s sigh. The girl would talk with her friends in the
novices’ quarters. The son of a queen was a natural topic, especially when
he was handsome and had an air about him like the hero in a gleeman’s tale.
A strange woman only made for more interesting speculation. Still, there
was nothing to be done about it. At any rate, it could hardly cause any harm
now.

“The Amyrlin Seat must be wondering why we haven’t come,” she said.

Sahra came to herself with a wide-eyed start and a loud gulp. Seizing Min’s
sleeve with one hand, she jumped to open one of the doors, pulling Min
behind her. The moment they were inside, the novice curtsied hastily and
burst out in panic, “I’ve brought her, Leane Sedai. Mistress Elmindreda?
The Amyrlin Seat wants to see her?”

The tall, coppery-skinned woman in the anteroom wore the hand-wide stole
of the Keeper of the Chronicles, blue to show she had been raised from the
Blue Ajah. Fists on hips, she waited for the girl to finish, then dismissed her
with a dipped “Took you long enough, child. Back to your chores, now.”
Sahra bobbed another curtsy and scurried out as quickly as she had entered.

Min stood with her eyes on the floor, her hood still pulled up around her
face. Blundering in front of Sahra had been bad enough-though at least the
novice did not know her name-but Leane knew her better than anyone in the
Tower except the Amyrlin. Min was sure it could make no difference now,
but after what had happened in the hallway, she meant to hold to Moiraine’s
instructions until she was alone with the Amyrlin.



This time her precautions did no good. Leane took two steps, pushed back
the hood, and grunted as if she had been poked in the stomach. Min raised
her head and stared back defiantly, trying to pretend she had not been
attempting to sneak past. Straight, dark hair only a little longer than her own
framed the Keeper’s face; the Aes Sedai’s expression was a blend of
surprise and displeasure at being surprised.

“So you are Elmindreda, are you?” Leant said briskly. She was always
brisk. “I must say you look it more in that dress than in your usual . . .
garb.”

“Just Min, Leane Sedai, if you please.” Min managed to keep her face
straight, but it was difficult not to glare. The Keeper’s voice had held too
much amusement. If her mother had had to name her after someone in a
story, why did it have to be a woman who seemed to spend most of her time
sighing at men, when she was not inspiring them to compose songs about
her eyes, or her smile?

“Very well. Min. I’ll not ask where you’ve been, nor why you’ve come
back in a dress, apparently wanting to ask a question of the Amyrlin. Not
now, at least.” Her face said she meant to ask later, though, and

get answers. “I suppose the Mother knows who Elmindreda is? Of course. I
should have known that when she said to send you straight in, and alone.
The Light alone knows why she puts up with you.” She broke off with a
concerned frown. “What is the matter, girl? Are you ill?”

Min carefully blanked her face. “No. No, I am all right.” For a moment the
Keeper had been looking through a transparent mask of her own face, a
screaming mask. “May I go in now, Leane Sedai?”

Leane studied her a moment longer, then jerked her head toward the inner
chamber. “In with you.”

Min’s leap to obey would have satisfied the hardest taskmistress.

The Amyrlin Seat’s study had been occupied by many grand and powerful
women over the centuries, and reminders of the fact filled the room, from



the tall fireplace all of golden marble from Kandor, cold now, to the paneled
walls of pale, oddly striped wood, iron hard yet carved in wondrous beasts
and wildly feathered birds. Those panels had been brought from the
mysterious lands beyond the Aiel Waste well over a thousand years ago,
and the fireplace was more than twice as old. The polished redstone of the
floor had come from the Mountains of Mist. High arched windows let onto
a balcony. The iridescent stone framing the windows shone like pearls, and
had been salvaged from the remains of a city sunk into the Sea of Storms by
the Breaking of the World; no one had ever seen its like.

The current occupant, Siuan Sanche, had been born a fisherman’s daughter
in Tear, though, and the furnishings she had chosen were simple, if well
made and well polished. She sat in a stout chair behind a large table plain
enough to have served a farmhouse. The only other chair in the room, just
as plain and usually set off to one side, now stood in front of the table atop a
small Tairen rug, simple in blue and brown and gold. Half a dozen books
rested open on tall reading stands about the floor. That was all of it. A
drawing hung above the fireplace: tiny fishing boats working among reeds
in the Fingers of the Dragon, just as her father’s boat had.

At first glance, despite her smooth Aes Sedai features, Siuan Sanche herself
looked as simple as her furnishings. She herself was sturdy, and handsome
rather than beautiful, and the only bit of ostentation in her clothing was the
broad stole of the Amyrlin Seat she wore, with one colored stripe for each
of the seven Ajahs.

Her age was indeterminate, as with any Aes Sedai; not even a hint of gray
showed in her dark hair. But her sharp blue eyes brooked no nonsense, and
her firm jaw spoke of the determination of the youngest woman ever to be
chosen Amyrlin Seat. For over ten years Siuan Sanche had been able to
summon rulers, and the powerful, and they had come, even if they hated the
White Tower and feared Aes Sedai.

As the Amyrlin strode around in front of the table, Min set down her bundle
and began an awkward curtsy, muttering irritably under her breath at having
to do so. Not that she wanted to be disrespectful - that did not even occur to
one facing a woman like Siuan Sanche - but the bow she usually would



have made seemed foolish in a dress, and she had only a rough idea of how
to curtsy.

Halfway down, with her skirts already spread, she froze like a crouching
toad. Siuan Sanche was standing there as regal as any queen, and for a
moment she was also lying on the floor, naked. Aside from her being in
only her skin, there was something odd about the image, but it vanished
before Min could say what. It was as strong a viewing as she had ever seen,
and she had no idea what it meant.

“Seeing things again, are you?” the Amyrlin said. “Well, I can certainly
make use of that ability of yours. I could have used it all the months you
were gone. But we’ll not talk of that. What’s done is done. The Wheel
weaves as the Wheel wills.” She smiled a tight smile. “But if you do it
again, I’ll have your hide for gloves. Stand up, girl. Leane forces enough
ceremony on me in a month to last any sensible woman a year. I don’t have
time for it. Not these days. Now, what did you just see?”

Min straightened slowly. It was a relief to be back with someone who knew
of her talent, even if it was the Amyrlin Seat herself. She did not have to
hide what she saw from the Amyrlin. Far from it. “You were....

You weren’t wearing any clothes. I . . . I don’t know what it means,
Mother.”

Siuan barked a short, mirthless laugh. “No doubt that I’ll take a lover. But I
have no time for that, either.

There’s no time for winking at the men when you’re busy bailing the boat.”

“Maybe,” Min said slowly. It could have meant that, though she doubted it.
“I just do not know. But, Mother, I’ve been seeing things ever since I
walked into the Tower. Something bad is going to happen, something
terrible.”

She started with the Aes Sedai in the entry hall and told everything she had
seen, as well as what everything meant, when she was sure. She held back
what Gawyn had said, though, or most of it; it was no use



telling him not to anger the Amyrlin if she did it for him. The rest she laid
out as starkly as she had seen it.

Some of her fear came out as she dredged it all up, seeing it all again; her
voice shook before she was done.

The Amyrlin’s expression never changed. “So you spoke with young
Gawyn,” she said when Min finished. “Well, I think I can convince him to
keep quiet. And if I remember Sahra correctly, the girl could do with some
time working in the country. She’ll spread no gossip hoeing a vegetable
patch.”

“I don’t understand,” Min said. “Why should Gawyn keep quiet? About
what? I told him nothing. And Sahra . . . ? Mother, perhaps I didn’t make
myself clear. Aes Sedai and Warders are going to die. It has to mean a
battle. And unless you send a lot of Aes Sedai and Warders off somewhere -
and servants, too; I saw servants dead and injured, too - unless you do that,
that battle will be here! In Tar Valon!”

“Did you see that?” The Amyrlin demanded. “A battle? Do you know, with
your . . . your talent, or are you guessing?”

“What else could it be? At least four Aes Sedai are as good as dead. Mother,
I’ve only laid eyes on nine of you since coming back, and four are going to
die! And the Warders . . . . What else could it be?”

“More things than I like to think of,” Siuan said grimly. “When? How long
before this . . . thing . . .

occurs?”

Min shook her head. “I do not know. Most of it will happen in the space of
a day, maybe two, but that could be tomorrow or a year from now. Or ten.”

“Let us pray for ten. If it comes tomorrow, there isn’t much I can do to stop
it.”



Min grimaced. Only two Aes Sedai besides Siuan Sanche knew of what she
could do: Moiraine, and Verin Mathwin, who had tried to study her talent.
None of them knew how it worked any more than she did, except that it had
nothing to do with the Power. Perhaps that was why only Moiraine seemed
able to accept the fact that when she knew what a viewing meant, it
happened.

“Maybe it’s the Whitecloaks, Mother. They were everywhere in Alindaer
when I crossed the bridge.”

She did not believe the Children of the Light had anything to do with what
was coming, but she was reluctant to say what she believed. Believed, not
knew; yet that was bad enough.

But the Amyrlin had begun shaking her head before she finished. “They
would try something if they could, I’ve no doubt - they would love to strike
at the Tower - but Eamon Valda won’t move openly without orders from the
Lord Captain Commander, and Pedron Niall will not strike unless he thinks
we’re injured. He knows our strength too well to be foolish. For a thousand
years the Whitecloaks have been like that. Silverpike in the reeds, waiting
for a hint of Aes Sedai blood in the water. But we’ve showed them none
yet, nor will we, if I can help it.”

“Yet if Valda did try something on his own - ”

Siuan cut her off. “He has no more than five hundred men dose to Tar
Valon, girl. He sent the rest away weeks ago, to cause trouble elsewhere.
The Shining Walls held off the Aiel. And Artur Hawkwing, too. Valda will
never break into Tar Valon unless the city is already falling apart from the
inside.” Her voice did not change as she went on. “You very much want me
to believe the trouble will come from the Whitecloaks. Why?”

There was no gentleness in her eyes.

“Because I want to believe it,” Min muttered. She licked her lips and spoke
the words she did not want to say. “The silver collar I saw on that one Aes
Sedai. Mother, it looked . . . It looked like one of the collars the .



. . the Seanchan use to . . . to control women who can channel.” Her voice
dwindled as Siuan’s mouth twisted with distaste.

“Filthy things,” the Amyrlin growled. “As well most people don’t believe a
quarter of what they hear about the Seanchan. But there’s more chance of it
being the Whitecloaks. If the Seanchan land again, anywhere, I will know it
in days by pigeon, and it is a long way from the sea to Tar Valon. If they do
reappear, I will have plenty of warning. No, I fear what you see is
something far worse that the Seanchan. I fear it can only be the Black Ajah.
Only a handful of us know about them, and I don’t relish what will happen
when the knowledge becomes common, but they are the greatest immediate
threat to the Tower.”

Min realized she was clutching her skirt so hard that her hands hurt; her
mouth was dry as dust. The White Tower had always coldly denied the
existence of a hidden Ajah, dedicated to the Dark One. The surest way to
anger an Aes Sedai was merely to mention such a thing. For the Amyrlin
Seat herself to give the Black Ajah reality so casually made Min’s spine
turn to ice.

As if she had said nothing out of the ordinary, the Amyrlin went on. “But
you didn’t come all this way just to do your viewings. What word from
Moiraine? I know everything from Arad Doman to Tarabon is in chaos, to
say the least.” That was saying the least, indeed; men supporting the
Dragon Reborn were fighting those opposing him, and had turned both
countries to civil war while they still fought each other for control of
Almoth Plain. Siuan’s tone dismissed all that as a detail. “But I’ve heard
nothing of Rand al’Thor for months.

He is the focus of everything. Where is he? What does Moiraine have him
doing? Sit, girl. Sit.” She gestured to the chair in front of the table.

Min approached the chair on wobbly legs and half fell into it. The Black
Ajah! Oh, Light! Aes Sedai were supposed to stand for the Light. Even if
she did not really trust them, there was always that. Aes Sedai, and all the
power of the Aes Sedai, stood for the Light and against the Shadow. Only
now it was not true any longer. She hardly heard herself say, “He’s on his
way to Tear.”



“Tear! It’s Callandor, then. Moiraine means him to take the Sword That
Cannot Be Touched out of the Stone of Tear. I swear I’ll hang her in the sun
to dry! I will make her wish she were a novice again! He cannot be ready
for that yet!”

“It was not . . . .” Min stopped to dear her throat. “It was not Moiraine’s
doing. Rand left in the middle of the night, by himself. The others followed,
and Moiraine sent me to tell you. They could be in Tear by now.

For all I know, he could have Callandor by now.”

“Burn him!” Siuan barked. “By now, he could be dead! I wish he had never
heard a word of the Prophecies of the Dragon. If I could keep him from
hearing another, I would.”

“But doesn’t he have to fulfill the Prophecies? I don’t understand.”

The Amyrlin leaned back against her table wearily. “As though anyone even
understands most of them!

The Prophecies aren’t what makes him the Dragon Reborn; all that takes is
for him to admit it, and he must have if he is going for Callandor. The
Prophecies are meant to announce to the world who he is, to prepare him
for what is coming, to prepare the world for it. If Moiraine can keep some
control over him, she will guide him to the Prophecies we can be sure of-
when he is ready to face them!-and for the rest, we trust that what he does is
enough. We hope. For all I know, he has already fulfilled Prophecies none
of us understands. The Light send it’s enough.”

”So you do mean to control him. He said you’d try to use him, but this is
the first I’ve heard you admit it.” Min felt cold inside. Angry, she added,
“You haven’t done such a good job of it so far, you and Moiraine.”

Siuan’s tiredness seemed to slide from her shoulders. She straightened and
stood looking down at Min.

“You had best hope we can. Did you think we could just let him run about
loose? Headstrong and stubborn, untrained, unprepared, maybe going mad



already. Do you think we could trust to the Pattern, to his destiny, to keep
him alive, like some story? This isn’t a story, he isn’t some invincible hero,
and if his thread is snipped out of the Pattern, the Wheel of Time won’t
notice his going, and the Creator will produce no miracles to save us. If
Moiraine cannot reef his sails, he very well may get himself killed, and
where are we then? Where is the world?

The Dark One’s prison is failing. He will touch the world again; it is only a
matter of time. If Rand al’Thor is not there to face him in the Last Battle, if
the headstrong young fool gets himself killed first, the world is doomed.
The War of the Power all over again, with no Lews Therin and his Hundred
Companions. Then fire and shadow, forever.” She stopped suddenly,
peering at Min’s face. “So that’s the way the wind sets, is it? You and Rand.
I did not expect this.”

Min shook her head vigorously, felt her cheeks coloring. “Of course not! I
was . . . . It’s the Last Battle.

And the Dark One. Light, just thinking about the Dark One loose ought to
be enough to freeze a Warder’s marrow. And the Black Ajah - ”

“Don’t try to dissemble,” the Amyrlin said sharply. “Do you think this is the
first time I ever saw a woman afraid for her man’s life? You might as well
admit it.”

Min squirmed on her chair. Siuan’s eyes dug at her, knowing and impatient.
“All right,” she muttered finally, “I’ll tell you all of it, and much good it
does either of us. The first time I ever saw Rand, I saw three women’s
faces, and one of them was mine. I’ve never seen anything about myself
before or since, but I knew what it meant. I was going to fall in love with
him. All three of us were.”

“Three. The other two. Who are they?”

Min gave her a bitter smile. “The faces were blurred; I don’t know who
they are.”

“Nothing to say that he would love you in return?”



“Nothing! He has never looked at me twice. I think he sees me as . . . as a
sister. So don’t think you can use me as leash on him, because it will not
work!”

“Yet you do love him.”

“I don’t have any choice.” Min tried to make her voice less sullen. “I tried
treating it as a joke, but I can’t laugh anymore. You may not believe me, but
when I know what it means, it happens.”

The Amyrlin tapped a finger against her lips and looked at Min
consideringly.

That look worried Min. She had not meant to make such a show of herself,
nor to tell as much as she had. She had not told everything, but she knew
she should have learned by now not to give an Aes Sedai a lever, even if she
did of see how it could be used. Aes Sedai were skilled at finding ways.
“Mother, I v delivered Moiraine’s message, and I’ve told everything I know
of what my viewings meant. There’s no reason now I can’t put on my own
clothes and go.”

“Go where?”

“Tear.” After talking with Gawyn, trying to make sure he did not do
something foolish. She wished she dared ask where Egwene and the other
two were, but if the Amyrlin would not tell Elayne’s brother, there was
small chance she would tell Min.

And Siuan Sanche still had that weighing look in her eyes. “Or wherever
Rand is. I may be a fool, but I’m not the first woman to be a fool over a
man.”

“The first to be a fool over the Dragon Reborn. It will be dangerous, being
dose to Rand al’Thor once the world finds out who he is, what he is. And if
he now wields Callandor, the world will learn soon enough.

Half will want to kill him anyway, as if by killing him they can stop the
Last Battle, stop the Dark One from breaking free. A good many will die,



dose to him. It might be better for you to stay here.”

The Amyrlin sounded sympathetic, but Min did not believe it. She did not
believe Siuan Sanche was capable of sympathy. “I’ll take the risk; maybe I
can help him. With what I see. It isn’t even as if the Tower would be that
much safer, not so long as there is one Red sister here. They’ll see a man
who can channel and forget the Last Battle, and the Prophecies of the
Dragon.”

“So will many others,” Siuan broke in calmly. “Old ways of thinking are
hard to shed, for Aes Sedai as for anyone else.”

Min gave her a puzzled look. She seemed to be taking Min’s side of the
thing now. “It is no secret I am friends with Egwene and Nynaeve, and no
secret they’re from the same village as Rand. For the Red Ajah, that will be
connection enough. When the Tower finds out what he is, I would probably
be arrested before the day is out. So will Egwene and Nynaeve, if you don’t
have them hidden away somewhere.”

“Then you mustn’t be recognized. You catch no fish if they see the net. I
suggest you forget your coat and breeches for a time.” The Amyrlin smiled
like a cat smiling at a mouse.

“What fish do you expect to catch with me?” Min asked in a faint voice.
She thought she knew, and hoped desperately she was wrong.

Her hope did not stop the Amyrlin from saying, “The Black Ajah. Thirteen
of them fled, but I fear some remain. I cannot be sure who I can trust; for a
while I was afraid to trust anyone. You are no Darkfriend, I know, and your
particular talent may just be some help. At the very least, you’ll be another
trustworthy pair of eyes.”

“You’ve been planning this since I walked in, haven’t you? That’s why you
want to keep Gawyn and Sahra quiet.” Anger built up inside Min like steam
in a kettle. The woman said frog and expected people to jump. That they
usually did just made it worse. She was no frog, no dancing puppet. “Is this
what you did to Egwene and Elayne and Nynaeve? Send them off after the
Black Ajah? I wouldn’t put it past you!”



“You tend your own nets, child, and let those girls tend theirs. As far as you
are concerned, they are working penance on a farm. Do I make myself
plain?”

That unwavering stare made Min shift on her chair. It was easy to defy the
Amyrlin - until she started staring at you with those sharp, cold blue eyes.
“Yes, Mother.” The meekness of her reply rankled, but a glance at the
Amyrlin convinced her to let it lie. She plucked at the fine wool of her
dress. “I suppose it won’t kill me to wear this a little longer.” Suddenly
Siuan looked amused; Min felt her hackles rising.

“I fear that won’t be enough. Min in a dress is still Min in a dress to anyone
who looks dose. You cannot always wear a cloak with the hood up. No, you
must change everything that can be changed. For one thing, you will
continue to go by Elmindreda. It is your name, after all.” Min winced.
“Your hair is almost as long as

Leane’s, long enough to put in curls. For the rest. . . . I never had any use
for rouge and powder and paints, but Leane remembers the use of them.”

Min’s eyes had grown wider by the word since the mention of curls. “Oh,
no,” she gasped.

”No one will take you for Min who wears breeches once Leane makes you
into a perfect Elmindreda.”

“Oh, NO!”

“As to why you are staying in the Tower - a reason suitable for a fluttery
young woman who looks and acts nothing at all like Min.” The Amyrlin
frowned thoughtfully, ignoring Min’s efforts to break in. “Yes. I will let it
be put about that Mistress Elmindreda managed to encourage two suitors to
the point that she has to take shelter from them in the Tower until she can
decide between them. A few women still claim sanctuary each year, and
sometimes for reasons as silly.” Her face hardened, and her eyes sharpened.
“If you’re still thinking of Tear, think again. Consider whether you can be
of more help to Rand there, or here. If the Black Ajah brings the Tower



down, or worse, gains control, he loses even the little help I can give. So.
Are you a woman, or a lovesick girl?”

Trapped. Min could see it as plainly as a shackle on her leg. “Do you
always get your way with people, Mother?”

The Amyrlin’s smile was even colder this time. “Usually, child. Usually.”

Shifting her red-fringed shawl, Elaida stared thoughtfully at the door to the
Amyrlin’s study, through which the two young women had just vanished.
The novice came back out almost immediately, took one look at Elaida’s
face, and bleated like a frightened sheep. Elaida thought she recognized her,
though she could not bring the girl’s name to mind. She had more important
uses for her time than teaching wretched children.

“Your name?”

“Sahra, Elaida Sedai.” The girl’s reply was a breathless squeak. Elaida
might have no interest in novices, but the novices knew her, and her
reputation.

She remembered the girl now. A daydreamer with moderate ability who
would never be of any real power. It was doubtful she knew anything more
than Elaida had already seen and heard - or remembered much more than
Gawyn’s smile, for that matter. A fool. Elaida flicked a dismissive hand.

The girl dropped a curtsy so deep her face almost touched the floor tiles,
then fled at a dead run.

Elaida did not see her go. The Red sister had turned away, already
forgetting the novice. As she swept down the corridor, not a line marred her
smooth features, but her thoughts boiled furiously. She did not even notice
the servants, the novices and Accepted, who scrambled out of her way,
curtsying as she passed. Once she almost walked over a Brown sister with
her nose in a sheaf of notes. The plump Brown jumped back with a startled
squawk that Elaida did not hear.



Dress or no dress, she knew the young woman who had gone in to see the
Amyrlin. Min, who had spent so much time with the Amyrlin on her first
visit to the Tower, though for no reason anyone knew. Min, who was such
close friends with Elayne, Egwene, and Nynaeve. The Amyrlin was hiding
the whereabouts of those three. Elaida was sure of it. All reports that they
were serving penance on a farm had come at third or fourth hand from
Siuan Sanche, more than enough distance to hide any twisting of words to
avoid an outright lie. Not to mention the fact that all Elaida’s considerable
efforts to find this farm had yielded nothing.

“The Light burn her!” For a moment open anger painted her face. She was
not sure whether she meant Siuan Sanche or the Daughter-Heir. Either
would serve. A slender Accepted heard her, glanced at her face, and went as
white as her own dress; Elaida strode by without seeing her.

Apart from everything else, it infuriated her that she could not find Elayne.
Elaida had the Foretelling sometimes, the ability to foresee future events. If
it came seldom and faintly, that was still more than any Aes Sedai had had
since Gitara Moroso, dead now twenty years. The very first thing Elaida
had ever Foretold, while still an Accepted - and had known enough even
then to keep to herself - was that the Royal line of Andor would be the key
to defeating the Dark One in the Last Battle. She had attached herself to
Morgase as soon as it was clear Morgase would succeed to the throne, had
built her influence year by patient year. And now all her effort, all her
sacrifice - she might have been Amyrlin herself had she not concentrated all
her energies on Andor -

might be for naught because Elayne had disappeared.

With an effort she forced her thoughts back to what was important now.
Egwene and Nynaeve came from the same village as that strange young
man, Rand al’Thor. And Min knew him as well, however much she had
tried to hide the fact. Rand al’Thor lay at the heart of it.

Elaida had only seen him once, supposedly a shepherd from the Two
Rivers, in Andor, but looking every inch the Aielman. The Foretelling had
come to her at the sight of him. He was ta’veren, one of those rare
individuals who, instead of being woven into the Pattern as the Wheel of



Time chose, forced the Pattern to shape itself around them, for a time at
least. And Elaida had seen chaos swirling around him, division and strife
for Andor, perhaps for even more of the world. But Andor must be kept
whole, whatever else happened; that first Foretelling had convinced her of
that.

There were more threads, enough to snare Siuan in her own web. If the
rumors were to be believed, there were three ta’veren, not just one. All
three from the same village, this Emond’s Field, and all three near the same
age, odd enough to occasion a good deal of talk in the Tower. And on
Siuan’s journey to Shienar, near a year ago now, she had seen them, even
talked with them. Rand al’Thor. Perrin Aybara. Matrim Cauthon. It was said
to be mere happenstance. Just fortuitous chance. So it was said. Those who
said it did not know what Elaida knew.

When Elaida saw the young al’Thor man, it had been Moiraine who spirited
him away. Moiraine who had accompanied him, and the other two ta’veren,
in Shienar. Moiraine Damodred, who had been Siuan Sanche’s closest
friend when they were novices together. Had Elaida been one to make
wagers, she would have wagered that no one else in the Tower remembered
that friendship. On the day they were raised Aes Sedai, at the end of the
Aiel War, Siuan and Moiraine had walked away from one another and
afterward behaved almost like strangers. But Elaida had been one of the
Accepted over those two novices, had taught their lessons and chastised
them for slacking at chores, and she remembered. She could hardly believe
that their plot could stretch back so far-al’Thor could not have been born
much before that-yet it was the last link to tie them all together.

For her, it was enough.

Whatever Siuan was up to, she had to be stopped. Turmoil and chaos
multiplied on every side. The Dark One was sure to break free - the very
thought made Elaida shiver and wrap her shawl around her more tightly -

and the Tower had to be aloof from mundane struggles to face that. The
Tower had to be free to pull the strings to make the nations stand together,
free of the troubles Rand al’Thor would bring. Somehow, he had to be
stopped from destroying Andor.



She had told no one what she knew of al’Thor. She meant to deal with him
quietly, if possible. The Hall of the Tower already spoke of watching, even
guiding, these ta’veren; they would never agree to dispose of them, of the
one in particular, as he must be disposed of. For the good of the Tower. For
the good of the world.

She made a sound in her throat, dose to a growl. Siuan had always been
headstrong, even as a novice, had always thought much of herself for a poor
fisherman’s daughter, but how could she be fool enough to mix the Tower
in this without telling the Hall? She knew what was coming as well as
anyone. The only way it could be worse was if . . . .

Abruptly Elaida stopped, staring at nothing. Could it be that this al’Thor
could channel? Or one of the others? Most likely it would be al’Thor. No.
Surely not. Not even Siuan would touch one of those. She could not. “Who
knows what that woman could do?” she muttered. “She was never fit to be
the Amyrlin Seat.”

“Talking to yourself, Elaida? I know you Reds never have friends outside
your own Ajah, but surely you have friends to talk to inside it.”

Elaida turned her head to regard Alviarin. The swan-necked Aes Sedai
stared back with the insufferable coolness that was a hallmark of the White
Ajah. There was no love lost between Red and White; they had stood on
opposite sides in the Hall of the Tower for a thousand years. White stood
with Blue, and Siuan had been a Blue. But Whites prided themselves on
dispassionate logic.

“Walk with me,” Elaida said. Alviarin hesitated before falling in beside her.

At first the White sister arched a disparaging eyebrow at what Elaida had to
say concerning Siuan, but before the end she was frowning in
concentration. “You have no proof of anything . . . improper,” she said
when Elaida finally fell silent.

“Not yet,” Elaida said firmly. She permitted herself a tight smile when
Alviarin nodded. It was a beginning. One way or another, Siuan would be
stopped before she could destroy the Tower.



Well hidden in a stand of tall leatherleaf above the north bank of the River
Taren, Dain Bornhald tossed back his white cloak, with its flaring golden
sun on the breast, and raised the stiff leather tube of a looking glass to his
eye. A cloud of tiny bitemes buzzed around his face, but he ignored them.
In the village of Taren Ferry, across the river, tall stone houses stood on
high foundations against the floods that came every spring. Villagers hung
out of windows or waited on stoops to stare at the thirty white-cloaked
riders sitting their horses in burnished plate-and-mail. A delegation of
village men and women were meeting with the horsemen. Rather, they were
listening to Jaret Byar, from what Bornhald could see, which was much the
best.

Bornhald could almost hear his father’s voice. Let them think there it a
chance, and some fool will try to take it. Then there’s killing to do, and
another fool will try to avenge the first, so there’s more killing. Put the fear
of the Light into them from the first, let them know no one will be harmed
if they do as they’re told, and you’ll have no trouble.

His jaw tightened at the thought of his father, dead now. He was going to do
something about that, and soon. He was sure only Byar knew why he had
leaped to accept this command, aimed at an all-but-forgotten district in the
hinterlands of

Andor, and Byar would hold his tongue. Byar had been as dedicated to
Dain’s father as a hound, and he had transferred all that loyalty to Dain.
Bornhald had had no hesitation in naming Byar second under him when
Eamon Valda gave him the command.

Byar turned his horse and rode back onto the ferry. Immediately the
ferrymen cast off and began hauling the barge across by means of a heavy
rope slung over the swiftly flowing water. Byar glanced at the men at the
rope; they eyed him nervously as they tramped the length of the barge, then
trotted back to take up the cable again. It all looked good.

“Lord Bornhald?”

Bomhald lowered the looking glass and turned his head. The hard-faced
man who had appeared at his shoulder stood rigid, staring straight ahead



from under a conical helmet. Even after the hard journey from Tar Valon -
and Bornhald had pressed every mile - his armor shone as brightly as his
snowy cloak with its golden sunburst.

“Yes, Child Ivon?”

“Hundredman Farran sent me, my Lord. It’s the Tinkers. Ordeith was
talking to three of them, my Lord, and now none of the three can be found.”

“Blood and ashes!” Bornhald spun on his bootheel and strode back into the
trees, Ivon at his heels.

Out of sight of the river, white-cloaked horsemen clogged the spaces
between leatherleafs and pines, lances held with casual familiarity or bows
laid across their pommels. The horses stamped their hooves impatiently and
flicked their tails. The riders waited more stolidly; this would not be their
first-river crossing into strange territory, and this time no one would be
trying to stop them.

In a large clearing beyond the mounted men stood a caravan of the
Tuatha’an, the Traveling People.

Tinkers. Nearly a hundred horse-drawn wagons, like small, boxy houses on
wheels, made an eye-jarring blend of colors, red and green and yellow and
every hue imaginable in combinations only a Tinker’s eye could like.

The people themselves wore clothes that made their wagons look dull. They
sat on the ground in a large cluster, eyeing the mounted men with an oddly
calm unease; the thin crying of a child was swiftly comforted by its mother.
Nearby, dead mastiffs made a mound already buzzing with flies. Tinkers
would not raise a hand even to defend themselves, and the dogs had been
mostly show, but Bornhald had not been willing to take a chance.

Six men were all he had thought necessary to watch Tinkers. Even with stiff
faces, they looked embarrassed. None glanced at the seventh man sitting a
horse near the wagons, a bony little man with a big nose, in a dark gray coat
that looked too big for him despite the fineness of its cut. Farran, a bearded
boulder of a man yet light on his feet for all his height and width, stood



glaring at all seven equally. The hundredman pressed a gauntleted hand to
his heart in salute but left all talking to Bornhald.

“A word with you, Master Ordeith,” Bornhald said quietly. The bony man
cocked his head, looking at Bornhald for a long moment before
dismounting. Farren growled, but Bornhald kept his voice low. “Three of

the Tinkers cannot be found, Master Ordeith. Did you perhaps put your own
suggestion into practice?” The first words out of Ordeith’s mouth when he
saw the Tinkers had been “Kill them. They’re of no use.” Bornhald had
killed his share of men, but he had never matched the casualness with
which the little man had spoken.

Ordeith rubbed a finger along the side of his large nose. “Now, why would I
be killing them? And after you ripped me so for just suggesting it.” His
Lugarder accent was heavy today; it came and went without him seeming to
notice, another thing about the man that disturbed Bornhald.

“Then you allowed them to escape, yes?”

“Well, as to that, I did take a few of them off where I could see what they
knew. Undisturbed, you see.”

“What they knew? What under the Light could Tinkers know of use to us?”

“There’s no way of telling until you ask, now is there?” Ordeith said. “I
didn’t hurt any of them much, and I told them to get themselves back to the
wagons. Who would be thinking they’d have the nerve to run away with so
many of your men about?”

Bornhald realized he was grinding his teeth. His orders had been to make
the best time possible to meet this odd fellow, who would have more orders
for him. Bornhald liked none of it, though both sets of orders bore the seal
and signature of Pedron Niall, Lord Captain Commander of the Children of
the Light.

Too much had been left unsaid, including Ordeith’s exact status. The little
man was there to advise Bornhald, and Bornhald was to cooperate with



Ordeith. Whether Ordeith was under his command had been left vague, and
he did not like the strong implication that he should heed the fellow’s
advice. Even the reason for sending so many of the Children into this
backwater had been vague. To root out Darkfriends, of course, and spread
the Light; that went without saying. But close to half a legion on Andoran
soil without permission - the order risked much if word of it reached the
Queen in Caemlyn. Too much to be balanced by the few answers Bornhald
had been given.

It all came back to Ordeith. Bornhald did not understand how the Lord
Captain Commander could trust this man, with his sly grins and his black
moods and his haughty stares so you could never be sure what kind of man
you were talking to. Not to mention his accent changing in the middle of a
sentence. The fifty Children who had accompanied Ordeith were as sullen
and frowning a lot as Bornhald had ever seen. He thought Ordeith must
have picked them himself to have so many sour scowls, and it said
something of the man that he would choose that sort. Even his name,
Ordeith, meant “wormwood” in the Old Tongue. Still, Bornhald had his
own reasons for wanting to be where he was. He would cooperate with the
man, since he had to. But only as much as he had to.

“Master Ordeith,” he said in a carefully level tone, “this ferry is the only
way in or out of the Two Rivers district.” That was not quite the truth.
According to the map he had, there was no way across the Taren except
here, and the upper reaches of the Manetherendrelle, bordering the region
on the south, had no fords. To the east lay bogs and swamps. Even so, there
must be a way out westward, across the Mountains of Mist, though his map
stopped at the edge of the range. At best, however, it would be a hard
crossing that many of his men might not survive, and he did not intend to
let Ordeith know of even that small chance. “When it is time to leave, if I
find Andoran soldiers holding this bank, you will ride with the first to cross.
You will find it interesting to see at close hand the difficulty of forcing a
way across a river this wide, yes?”

“This is your first command, is it not?” Ordeith’s voice held a hint of
mockery.



“This may be part of Andor on the map, but Caemlyn has not sent a tax
collector this far west in generations. Even if those three talk, who will
believe three Tinkers? If you think the danger is too great, remember whose
seal is on your orders.”

Farran glanced at Bornhald, half reached for his sword. Bornhald shook his
head slightly, and Farran let his hand fall. “I mean to cross the river, Master
Ordeith. I will cross if the next word I hear is that Gareth Bryne and the
Queen’s Guards will be here by sundown.”

“Of course,” Ordeith said, suddenly soothing. “There will be as much glory
here as at Tar Valon, I assure you.” His deep, dark eyes took a glazed look,
stared at something in the distance. “There are things in Tar Valon I want,
too.”

Bornhald shook his head. And I must cooperate with him.

Jaret Byar drew up and swung down from his saddle beside Farran. As tall
as the hundredman, Byar was a long-faced man with dark, deep-set eyes.
He looked as if every ounce of fat had been boiled off of him. “The village
is secured, my Lord. Lucellin is making certain no one slips off. They
nearly soiled themselves when I

mentioned Darkfriends. None in their village, they say. The folk futher
south are the Darkfriend kind, though, they say.”

“Further south, is it?” Bornhald said briskly. “We shall see. Put three
hundreds across the river, Byar.

Farran’s first. The rest to follow after the Tinkers cross. And make sure no
more of them get away, yes?”

“We will scour the Two Rivers,” Ordeith broke in. His narrow face was
twisted; saliva bubbled at his lips. “We will flog them, and flay them, and
sear their souls! I promised him! He’ll come to me, now! He will come!”

Bornhald nodded for Byar and Farran to carry out his commands. A
madman, he thought. The Lord Captain Commander has tied me to a



madman. But at least I will find my path to Perrin of the Two Rivers.

Whatever it takes, I will avenge my father!

From a colonnaded terrace on a hilltop, the High Lady Suroth looked across
the wide, lopsided bowl of Cantorin Harbor. The shaven sides of her scalp
left a wide crest of black hair that fell down her back. Her hands rested
lightly on a smooth stone balustrade as white as her pristine gown with its
hundreds of pleats. There was a faint rhythmic clicking as she
unconsciously drummed her fingers with their inch-long nails, the first two
on each hand lacquered blue.

A slight breeze blew off of the Aryth Ocean, carrying more than a hint of
salt in its coolness. Two young women kneeling against the wall behind the
High Lady held white-plumed fans ready if the breeze should fail.

Two more women and four young men completed the line of crouching
figures waiting to serve. Barefoot, all eight wore sheer robes, to please the
High Lady’s aesthetic senses with the dean lines of their limbs and the grace
of their motions. At the moment Suroth truly did not see the servants, no
more than one saw furniture.

She saw the six Deathwatch Guards at either end of the colonnade, though,
stiff as statues with their black-tasseled spears and black-lacquered shields.
They symbolized her triumph, and her danger. The Deathwatch Guard
served only the Empress and her chosen representatives, and they would
kill or die with equal fervor, whichever was necessary. There was a saying:
“On the heights, the paths are paved with daggers.”

Her fingernails clicked on the stone balustrade. How thin was the razor’s
edge she walked.

Vessels of the Atha’an Miere, the Sea Folk, filled the inner harbor behind
the seawall, even the largest looking too narrow for their length. Cut rigging
made their yards and booms slant at crazy angles. Their decks were empty,
their crews ashore and under guard, as were any in these islands who had
the skill to sail the open sea. Great, bluff-bowed



Seanchan ships by the score lay in the outer harbor, and anchored off the
harbor mouth. One, its ribbed sails bellied with wind, escorted a swarm of
small fishing boats back toward the island port. If the smaller craft
scattered, some of them might escape, but the Seanchan ship carried a
damane, and one demonstration of a damane’s power had quelled any such
thoughts. The charred, shattered hulk of the Sea Folk ship still lay on a
mudflat near the harbor mouth.

How long she would manage to keep Sea Folk elsewhere - and the accursed
mainlanders - from learning that she held these islands, Suroth did not
know. It will be long enough, she told herself. It must be long enough.

She had worked something of a miracle in rallying most of the Seanchan
forces after the debacle the High Lord Turak had led them to. All but a
handful of the vessels that had escaped from Falme lay under her control,
and no one questioned her right to command the Hailene, the Forerunners.
If her miracle held, no one on the mainland suspected they were here.
Waiting to take back the lands the Empress had sent them to reclaim,
waiting to achieve the Corenne, the Return. Her agents already scouted the
way. There would be no need to return to the Court of the Nine Moons and
apologize to the Empress for a failure not even hers.

The thought of having to apologize to the Empress sent a tremor through
her. Such an apology was always humiliating, and usually painful, but what
made her shiver was the chance of being denied death at the end, of being
forced to continue as if nothing had occurred while everyone, common as
well as the Blood, knew her degradation. A handsome young serving man
sprang to her side, bearing a pale green robe worked in brilliantly plumaged
birds-of-delight. She held her arms out for the garment and noticed him no
more than a clod of dirt beside her velvet slipper.

To escape that apology, she must retake what had been lost a thousand years
ago. And to do that, she must deal with this man who, her mainland agents
told her, claimed to be the Dragon Reborn. If I cannot find a way to deal
with him, the displeasure of the Empress will be the least of my worries.

Turning smoothly, she entered the long room fronting the terrace, its outer
wall all doors and tall windows to catch the breezes. The pale wood of the



walls, smooth and glistening like satin, pleased Suroth, but she had
removed the furnishings of the old owner, the former Atha’an Miere
governor of Cantorin, and replaced them with a few tall screens, most
painted with birds or flowers. Two were different. One showed a great
spotted cat of the Sen T’jore, as large as a pony, the other a black mountain
eagle, crest erect like a pale crown and snowy-tipped wings spread to their
full seven feet. Such screens were considered vulgar, but Suroth liked
animals. Unable to bring her menagerie with her across the Aryth Ocean,
she had had the screens made to depict her two favorites. She had never
taken kindly to being balked in anything.

Three women awaited her as she had left them, two kneeling, one lying
prostrate on the bare, polished floor, patterned in inlays of light and dark
wood. The kneeling women wore the dark blue dresses of sul’dam, red
panels embroidered with forked silver lightning on the breast and on the
sides of their skirts. One of the two, Alwhin, a sharp-faced, blue-eyed
woman with a perpetual glower, had the left side of her head shaved. The
rest of her hair hung to her shoulder in a light brown braid.

Suroth’s mouth tightened momentarily at the sight of Alwhin. No sul’dam
had ever before been raised to the so’jhin, the hereditary upper servants of
the Blood, much less to a Voice of the Blood. Yet there had been reasons in
Alwhin’s case.

Alwhin knew too much.

Still, it was to the woman lying facedown, all in plain dark gray, that Suroth
directed her attention. A wide collar of silvery metal encircled the woman’s
neck, connected by a shining leash to a bracelet of the same material on the
wrist of the second sul’dam, Taisa. By means of leash and collar, the a’dam,
Taisa could control the gray-clad woman. And she had to be controlled. She
was damane, a woman who could channel, and thus too dangerous to be
allowed to run loose. Memories of the Armies of the Night were still strong
in Seanchan a thousand years after their destruction.

Suroth’s eyes flickered uneasily to the two sul’dam. She no longer trusted
any sul’dam, and yet she had no choice but to trust them. No one else could
control the damane, and without the damane . . . The very concept was



unthinkable. The power of Seanchan, the very power of the Crystal Throne,
was built on controlled damane.

There were too many things about which Suroth had no choice to suit her.
Such as Alwhin, who watched as if she had been so’jhin all of her life. No.
As if she were of the Blood itself, and knelt because she chose to.

“Pura.” The damane had had another name when she was one of the hated
Aes Sedai, before falling into Seanchan hands, but Suroth neither knew
what it had been nor cared. The gray-clad woman tensed, but did not raise
her head; her training had been particularly harsh. “I will ask again, Pura.
How does the White Tower control this man who calls himself the Dragon
Reborn?”

The damane moved her head a fraction, enough to shoot a frightened look
at Taisa. If her answer was displeasing, the sul’dam could make her feel
pain without raising a finger, by means of the a’dam. “The Tower would not
try to control a false Dragon, High Lady,” Pura said breathily. “They would
capture him, and gentle him.”

Taisa looked an indignant question at the High Lady. The answer had
avoided Suroth’s query, had perhaps even implied that one of the Blood had
spoken untruth. Suroth gave a slight shake of her head, the merest sideways
motion - she had no wish to wait while the damane recovered from
punishment - and Taisa bowed her head in acquiescence.

“Once again, Pura, what do you know of Aes Sedai . . .” Suroth’s mouth
twisted at being defiled with that name; Alwhin gave a grunt of distaste “. .
. Aes Sedai aiding this man? I warn you. Our soldiers fought women of the
Tower, women channeling the Power, at Falme, so do not attempt to deny
it.”

“Pura . . . Pura does not know, High Lady.” There was urgency in the
damane’s voice, and uncertainty; she darted another wide-eyed glance at
Taisa. It was dear that she wanted desperately to be believed.

“Perhaps.... Perhaps the Amyrlin, or the Hall of the Tower .... No, they
would not. Pura does not know, High Lady.”



“The man can channel,” Suroth said curtly. The woman on the floor
moaned, though she had heard the same words from Suroth before. Saying
it again made

Suroth’s stomach knot, but she allowed nothing to show on her face. Little
of what had happened at Falme had been the work of women channeling;
damane could sense that, and the sul’dam wearing the bracelet always knew
what her damane felt. That meant it had to have been the work of the man.
It also meant he was incredibly powerful. So powerful that Suroth had once
or twice found herself wondering, growing queasy, whether he might really
be the Dragon Reborn. That cannot be, she told herself firmly. In any case,
it made no difference to her plans. “It is impossible to believe that even the
White Tower would allow such a man to walk free. How do they control
him?”

The damane lay there silently, face to the floor, shoulders shaking, weeping.

“Answer the High Lady!” Taisa said sharply. Taisa did not move, but Pura
gasped, flinching as if struck across the hips. A blow delivered through the
a’dam.

“P-Pura does not kn-know.” The damane stretched out a hesitant hand as
though to touch Suroth’s foot.

“Please. Pura has learned to obey. Pura speaks only the truth. Please do not
punish Pura.”

Suroth stepped back smoothly, letting none of her irritation show. That she
should be forced to move by a damane. That she could almost be touched
by one who could channel. She felt a need to bathe, as if the touch had
actually landed.

Taisa’s dark eyes bulged in outrage at the damane’s effrontery; her cheeks
were scarlet with shame that this should happen while she wore the
woman’s bracelet. She seemed torn between prostrating herself beside the
damane to beg forgiveness and punishing the woman then and there.
Alwhin stared a thin-lipped contempt, every line of her face saying that
such things did not happen when she wore a bracelet.



Suroth raised one finger a fraction, making a small gesture every so’jhin
knew from childhood, a simple dismissal.

Alwhin hesitated before interpreting it, then tried to cover her slip by
rounding harshly on Taisa. “Take this . . . creature from the presence of the
High Lady Suroth. And when you have punished her, go to Surela and tell
her that you control your charges as if you had never worn the bracelet
before. Tell her that you are to be - ”

Suroth shut Alwhin’s voice from her mind. None of that had been her
command except the dismissal, but quarrels between sul’dam were beneath
her notice. She wished she knew whether Pura was managing to hide
something. Her agents reported claims that the women of the White Tower
could not lie. It had not been possible to force Pura to tell even a simple lie,
to say that a white scarf was black, yet that was not enough to be
conclusive. Some might accept the tears of the damane, her protests of
inability whatever the sul’dam did, but none who did would have risen to
lead the Return. Pura might have some reservoir of will left, might be clever
enough to try using the belief that she was incapable of lying. None of the
women collared on the mainland were fully obedient, trustworthy, not like
the damane brought from Seanchan. None of them truly accepted what they
were, as Seanchan damane did. Who could say what secrets might hide in
one who had called herself Aes Sedai?

Not for the first time Suroth wished she had the other Aes Sedai who had
been captured on Toman Head. With two to question, there would have
been a better chance to catch lies and evasions. It was a useless wish. The
other could be dead, drowned at sea, or on display at the Court of the Nine
Moons. Some of the ships Suroth had failed to gather in must have
managed the journey back across the ocean, and one might well have
carried the woman.

She herself had sent a ship carrying carefully crafted reports, nearly half a
year ago now, as soon as she had solidified her control of the Forerunners,
with a captain and crew from families that had served hers since Luthair
Paendrag had proclaimed himself Emperor, nearly a thousand years ago.
Dispatching the ship had been a gamble, for the Empress might send back
someone to take Suroth’s place. Not sending the vessel would have been a



greater, though; only utter and crushing victory could have saved her then.
Perhaps not even that. So the Empress knew of Falme, knew of Turak’s
disaster and Suroth’s intention to go on. But what did she think of that
knowledge, and what was she doing about it? That was a greater concern
than any damane, whatever she had been before collaring.

Yet the Empress did not know everything. The worst could not be entrusted
to any messenger, no matter how loyal. It would only be passed from
Suroth’s lips directly to the ear of the Empress, and Suroth had taken

pains to keep it so. Only four still lived who knew the secret, and two of
those would never speak of it to anyone, not of their own volition. Only
three deaths can hold it more tightly.

Suroth did not realize she had murmured the last aloud until Alwhin said,
“And yet the High Lady needs all three alive.” The woman had a properly
humble suppleness to her stance, even to the trick of downcast eyes that still
managed to watch for any sign from Suroth. Her voice was humble, too.
“Who can say, High Lady, what the Empress - may she live forever! - might
do if she learned of an attempt to keep such knowledge from her?”

Instead of answering, Suroth made the tiny dismissing gesture once more.
Again Alwhin hesitated - this time it had to be simple reluctance to leave;
the woman rose above herself! - before bowing deeply and backing out of
Suroth’s presence.

With an effort Suroth found calmness. The sul’dam and the other two were
a problem she could not solve now, but patience was a necessity for the
Blood. Those who lacked it were likely to end in the Tower of Ravens.

On the terrace, kneeling servants leaned forward a hair in readiness as she
appeared again. The soldiers maintained their watch to see she was
undisturbed. Suroth took up her place before the balustrade, this time
staring out to sea, toward the mainland hundreds of miles to the east.

To be the one who successfully led the Forerunners, who began the Return,
would bring much honor.



Perhaps even adoption into the family of the Empress, though that was an
honor not without complications. To also be the one who captured this
Dragon, whether false or real, along with the means of controlling his
incredible power . . . .

But if - when - I take him, do I give him to the Empress? That is the
question.

Her long nails began to click again on the wide stone rail.

Chapter

2

Whirlpools in the Pattern

nland the hot night wind blew, north across the vast delta called the Fingers
of the Dragon, a winding maze of waterways broad and narrow, some
choked with knifegrass. Vast plains of reeds separated dusters of low
islands forested with spider-rooted trees seen nowhere else. Eventually the
delta gave way to its source, the River Erinin, the river’s great width spotted
with the lights of small boats lantern-fishing.

Boats and lights bobbed wildly, sudden and unexpected, and some older
men muttered of evil things passing in the night. Young men laughed, but
they hauled the nets more vigorously, too, eager to be home and out of the
dark. The stories said evil could not cross your threshold unless you invited
it in. That was what the stories said.

But out in the darkness. . . .



The last tang of salt had vanished by the time the wind reached the great
city of Tear, hard by the river, where tile-roofed inns and shops shouldered
against tall, towered palaces gleaming in the moonlight. Yet no palace was
half so tall as the massive bulk, almost a mountain, that stretched from
city’s heart to water’s edge.

The Stone of Tear, fortress of legend, the oldest stronghold of mankind,
erected in the last days of the Breaking of the World. While nations and
empires rose and fell, were replaced and fell anew, the Stone stood. It was
the rock on which armies had broken spears and swords and hearts for three
thousand years. And in all that time it had never fallen to invading arms.
Until now.

The streets of the city, the taverns and inns, were all but empty in the
muggy darkness, people keeping cautiously within their own walls. Who
held the Stone was lord of Tear, city and nation. That was the way it had
always been, and the people of Tear accepted it always. By daylight they
would cheer their new lord with enthusiasm as they had cheered the old; by
night they huddled together, shivering despite the heat when the wind
howled across their rooftops like a thousand keening mourners.

Strange new hopes danced in their heads, hopes none in Tear had dared for
a hundred generations, hopes mixed with fears as old as the Breaking.

The wind lashed the long, white banner catching the moon above the Stone
as if trying to rip it away.

Along its length marched a sinuous figure like a legged serpent, golden-
maned like a lion, scaled in scarlet and gold, seeming to ride the wind.
Banner of prophecy, hoped for and dreaded. Banner of the Dragon. The
Dragon Reborn. Harbinger of the world’s salvation, and herald of a new
Breaking to come. As if outraged at such defiance, the wind dashed itself
against the hard walls of the Stone. The Dragon banner floated, unheeding
in the night, awaiting greater storms.

In a room more than halfway up the Stone’s southern face, Perrin sat on the
chest at the foot of his canopied bed and watched the dark-haired young
woman pacing up and down. There was a trace of wariness in his golden



eyes. Usually Faile bantered with him, maybe poked a little gentle fun at his
deliberate ways; tonight she had not said ten words since coming through
the door. He could smell the rose petals that had been folded into her
clothes after cleaning, and the scent that was just her. And in the hint of
clean perspiration, he smelled nervousness. Faile almost never showed
nerves. Wondering why she did now set an itch between his shoulders that
had nothing to do with the night’s heat. Her narrow, divided skirts made a
soft whisk-whisk-whisk with her strides.

He scratched his two-week growth of beard irritably. It was even curlier
than the hair on his head. It was also hot. For the hundredth time he thought
of shaving.

“It suits you,” Faile said suddenly, stopping in her tracks.

Uncomfortably, he shrugged shoulders heavy from long hours working at a
forge. She did that sometimes, seemed to know what he was thinking. “It
itches,” he muttered, and wished he had spoken more forcefully. It was his
beard; he could shave it off any time he wanted.

She studied him, her head tilted to one side. Her bold nose and high
cheekbones made it seem a fierce study, a contrast to the soft voice in which
she said, “It looks right on you.”

Perrin sighed, and shrugged again. She had not asked him to keep the beard,
and she would not. Yet he knew he was going to put off shaving again. He
wondered how his friend Mat would handle this situation.

Probably with a pinch and a kiss and some remark that made her laugh until
he brought her around to his way of thinking. But Perrin knew he did not
have Mat’s way with the girls. Mat would never find himself sweating
behind a beard just because a woman thought he should have hair on his
face. Unless, maybe, the woman was Faile. Perrin suspected that her father
must deeply regret her leaving home, and not just because she was his
daughter. He was the biggest fur trader in Saldaea, so she claimed, and
Perrin could see her getting the price she wanted every time.

“Something is troubling you, Faile, and it isn’t my beard. What is it?”



Her expression became guarded. She looked everywhere but at him, making
a contemptuous survey of the room’s furnishings.

Carvings of leopards and lions, stooping hawks and hunting scenes
decorated everything from the tall wardrobe and bedposts as thick as his leg
to the padded bench in front of the cold marble fireplace. Some of the
animals had garnet eyes.

He had tried to convince the majhere that he wanted a simple room, but she
did not seem to understand.

Not that she was stupid or slow. The majhere commanded an army of
servants greater in numbers than the Defenders of the Stone; whoever
commanded the Stone, whoever held its walls, she saw to the day-to-day
matters that let everything function. But she looked at the world through
Tairen eyes. Despite his clothes, he must be more than the young
countryman he seemed, because commoners were never housed in the
Stone-save for Defenders and servants, of course. Beyond that, he was one
of Rand’s party, a friend or a follower or in any case close to the Dragon
Reborn in some way. To the majhere, that set him on a level with a Lord of
the Land at the very least, if not a High Lord. She had been scandalized
enough at putting him in here, without even a sitting room; he thought she
might have fainted if he had insisted on an even plainer chamber. If there
were such things short of the servants’ quarters, or the Defenders’. At least
nothing here was gilded except the candlesticks.

Faile’s opinions, though, were not his. “You should have better than this.
You deserve it. You can wager your last copper that Mat has better.”

“Mat likes gaudy things,” he said simply.

“You do not stand up for yourself.”

He did not comment. It was not his rooms that made her smell of unease,
any more than his beard.

After a moment, she said, “The Lord Dragon seems to have lost interest in
you. All his time is taken by the High Lords, now.”



The itch between his shoulders worsened; he knew what was troubling her
now. He tried to make his voice light. “The Lord Dragon? You sound like a
Tairen. His name is Rand.”

“He’s your friend, Perrin Aybara, not mine. If a man like that has friends.”
She drew a deep breath and went on in a more moderate tone. “I have been
thinking about leaving the Stone. Leaving Tear. I don’t think Moiraine
would try to stop me. News of . . . of Rand has been leaving the city for two
weeks, now. She can’t think to keep him secret any longer.”

He only just stopped another sigh. “I don’t think she will, either. If
anything, I think she considers you a complication. She will probably give
you money to see you on your way.”

Planting fists on hips, she moved to stare down at him. “Is that all you have
to say?”

“What do you want me to say? That I want you to stay?” The anger in his
own voice startled him. He was angry with himself, not her. Angry because
he had not seen this coming, angry because he could not see how to deal
with it. He liked being able to think things through. It was easy to hurt
people without meaning to

when you were hasty. He’d done that now. Her dark eyes were large with
shock. He tried to smooth his words.

“I do want you to stay, Faile, but maybe you should leave. I know you’re no
coward, but the Dragon Reborn, the Forsaken . . . .” Not that anywhere was
really safe - not for long, not now - yet there were safer places than the
Stone. For a while, anyway. Not that he was stupid enough to put it to her
that way.

But she did not appear to care how he put it. “Stay? The Light illumine me!
Anything is better than sitting here like a boulder, but . . . .” She knelt
gracefully in front of him, resting her hands on his knees.

“Perrin. I do not like wondering when one of the Forsaken is going to walk
around the corner in front of me, and I do not like wondering when the



Dragon Reborn is going to kill us all. He did it back in the Breaking, after
all. Killed everyone dose to him.”

“Rand isn’t Lews Therin Kinslayer,” Perrin protested. “I mean, he is the
Dragon Reborn, but he isn’t . . .

he wouldn’t. . . .” He trailed off, not knowing how to finish. Rand was Lews
Therin Telamon reborn; that was what being the Dragon Reborn meant. But
did it mean Rand was doomed to Lews Therin’s fate? Not just going mad -
any man who channeled had that fate in front of him, and then a rotting
death - but killing everyone who cared for him?

“I have been talking to Bain and Chiad, Perrin.”

That was no surprise. She spent considerable time with the Aiel women.
The friendship made some trouble for her, but she seemed to like the Aiel
women as much as she despised the Stone’s Tairen noblewomen.

But he saw no connection to what they were talking about, and he said so.

“They say Moiraine sometimes asks where you are. Or Mat. Don’t you see?
She would not have to do that if she could watch you with the Power.”

“Watch me with the Power?” he said faintly. He had never even considered
that.

“She cannot. Come with me, Perrin. We can be twenty miles across the
river before she misses us.”

“I can’t,” he said miserably. He tried diverting her with a kiss, but she
leaped to her feet and backed away so fast he nearly fell on his face. There
was no point going after her. She had her arms crossed beneath her breasts
like a barrier.

“Don’t tell me you are that afraid of her. I know she is Aes Sedai, and she
has all of you dancing when she twitches the strings. Perhaps she has the . .
. Rand . . . so tied he cannot get loose, and the Light knows Egwene and



Elayne, and even Nynaeve, don’t want to, but you can break her cords if
you try.”

“It has nothing to do with Moiraine. It’s what I have to do. I - ”

She cut him short. “Don’t you dare hand me any of that hairy-chested drivel
about a man having to do his duty. I know duty as well as you, and you
have no duty here. You may be ta’veren, even if I don’t see it, but he is the
Dragon Reborn, not you.”

“Will you listen?” he shouted, glaring, and she jumped. He had never
shouted at her before, not like that.

She raised her chin and shifted her shoulders, but she did not say anything.
He went on. “I think I am part of Rand’s destiny, somehow. Mat, too. I think
he can’t do what he has to unless we do our part, as well. That is the duty.
How can I walk away if it might mean Rand will fail?”

“Might?” There was a hint of demand in her voice, but only a hint. He
wondered if he could make himself shout at her more often. “Did Moiraine
tell you this, Perrin? You should know by now to listen closely to what an
Aes Sedai says.”

“I worked it out for myself. I think ta’veren are pulled toward each other.
Or maybe Rand pulls us, Mat and me both. He’s supposed to be the
strongest ta’veren since Artur Hawkwing, maybe since the Breaking. Mat
won’t even admit he’s ta’veren, but however he tries to get away, he always
ends up drawn back to Rand. Loial says he has never heard of three
ta’veren, all the same age and all from the same place.”

Faile sniffed loudly. “Loial does not know everything. He isn’t very old for
an Ogier.”

“He’s past ninety,” Perrin said defensively, and she gave him a tight smile.
For an Ogier, ninety years was not much older than Perrin. Or maybe
younger. He did not know much about Ogier. In any case, Loial had read
more books than Perrin had ever seen or even heard of; sometimes he
thought Loial had read every book ever printed.
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